
In the afternoon, we will explore "Tierra Firme Forest". Then 
we will return to M/V ANAKONDA

SUNDAY TO WEDNESDAY

4 DAYS / 3 NIGHTS

Day 1: Quito - Coca - Napo River

Flight from Mariscal Sucre Airporte (Quito) to Francisco de 
Orellana Airport (Coca)

Transfer from Francisco de Orellana Airport (Coca) to Pier 
La Mision

A river canoe will take us along this outstanding river where 
we will encounter turtles, monkeys and pink river dolphins. 
Panococha's lake is also the habitat of pirhanas, monkey fish 
and white caiman

Stop to enjoy a delicious BBQ Amazon style

A motorized canoe will take us along the Napo River, until 
we reach the M/V ANAKONDA. On the way we weill enjoy 
amazin views of the rainforest and Napo's riverside.

Enjoy the facilities of M/V ANAKONDA and the fascinating 
landscapes

Time to get adventurous and discover the amazing 
biodiversity of the rainforest in the dark. 

Day 2: Visit Panacocha's Protected Rainforest and Tierra Firme Forest

While heading downstream, we will encounter the Pañayacu 
Rive's confluence



Day 4: Return

We will start heading back

Disembark the M/V ANAKONDA to take a motorized canoe 
that will take us to the Mision Pier in Coca

Transfer from Pier La Mision to Francisco de Orellana 
Airport (Coca)

Flight from Francisco de Orellana Airport (Coca) to Mariscal 
Sucre Airport (Quito)

We will visit Sani Warmi Kichwa Interpretation Center, 
where a group of Kichwa people will tell us about their 
customs, cuisine and everyday life.

Lunch is taken in the "Interpretation Kichwa Center"

Later, a visit to the Charapa's (River turtles) Rescue Center 
and explore the Indillama River located in the northern edge 
of the Yasuní National Park

Day 3: Clay Licks for Parrots, Sani Warmi Interpretation Center and Charapa's 
Rescue Center

We will enjoy one of the most amazing spectacles of wildlife 
known as Parrots Clay Licks


